
From: James, Andrew G - DNR 
Sent: Tuesday, March 9, 2021 3:05 PM 
To: 'wcabmw2@gmail.com' 
Cc: 'dlyster@msa-ps.com' 
Subject: Site Status Update Requested - Winners Circle Automotive - BRRTS # 03-39-

168015 
 
Mr. Berndt, 
 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources (WDNR) is requesting an update on the status of the 
Bureau of Remediation and Redevelopment Tracking System (BRRTS) case, “Winners Circle Automotive” 
BRRTS # 03-39-168015. On June 18, 2020, WDNR received a closure request packet prepared by MSA 
Professional Services Inc, without the required closure fees ($1700.00).  As discussed on our November 
19, 2020, phone call, you must provide the closure fees associated with your June 18, 2020, closure 
submittal in order for the WDNR to review your request for case closure.  
The closure fees may be mailed to: 
 
Denise Danelski 
Environmental Program Associate 
2984 Shawano Avenue 
Green Bay, Wi 54313 
 
The fees may be made payable to: 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources 
 
Please contact me if you have any questions or concerns.  
 
Sincerely, 
Andy James 
 
 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 
 

Andy James 

Hydrogeologist Remediation & Redevelopment Program 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources 
2984 Shawano Avenue 
Green Bay, WI 54313 
Cell: 715-527-0114  
Andrew.James@wisconsin.gov 
 

 dnr.wi.gov 

     

 

From: James, Andrew G - DNR  
Sent: Tuesday, December 1, 2020 11:06 AM 
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http://dnr.wi.gov/rss/


To: wcabmw2@gmail.com 
Subject: Winners Circle Automotive BRRTS # 03-39-168015 
 
Mr. Berndt, 
I am writing to you to respond to your phone call and voice message from November 20th. I apologize, I 
have been out of the office and now have lost my voice. For the time being email will be the best way to 
communicate regarding your question. If I do not hear back from you, I will give you a call when I am 
able. I am just not sure how long it will be. Thank you and have a good afternoon. 
 
Sincerely, 
Andy James 
 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 
 

Andy James 

Hydrogeologist Remediation & Redevelopment Program 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources 
2984 Shawano Avenue 
Green Bay, WI 54313 
Cell: 715-527-0114  
Andrew.James@wisconsin.gov 
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