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Foellmi, Thomas J - DNR

From: DiMaggio, Janet H - DNR
Sent: Tuesday, June 15, 2021 4:56 PM
To: Langdon, Robert
Subject: RE: Eurofins TestAmerica report files from 500-200205-1 Matthews Estate - 25219145.00

You may abandon the wells Rob. Not much there. 
 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 
 

Janet DiMaggio, P.G. 
Cell Phone: (608) 219‐2155 
janet.dimaggio@wisconsin.gov 

 

From: Langdon, Robert <RLangdon@scsengineers.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 15, 2021 4:11 PM 
To: DiMaggio, Janet H ‐ DNR <Janet.DiMaggio@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: FW: Eurofins TestAmerica report files from 500‐200205‐1 Matthews Estate ‐ 25219145.00 

 
Hi Janet, here’s the laboratory report for the recent GW samples for Matthews Estate.  We’ll prepare updated 
analytical summary tables, but I wanted to get the report to you sooner rather than later.   
 
OK to abandon the wells? 
 
Robert Langdon 
Senior Project Manager 
SCS Engineers 
2830 Dairy Drive 
Madison, WI  53718‐6751  USA 
608‐216‐7329 (W) 
608‐212‐3995 (C) 
rlangdon@scsengineers.com 
 

www.scsengineers.com 
 

From: Sandie Fredrick <sandra.fredrick@eurofinset.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 15, 2021 3:15 PM 
To: Valcheff, Jess <JValcheff@scsengineers.com>; Langdon, Robert <RLangdon@scsengineers.com> 
Subject: Eurofins TestAmerica report files from 500‐200205‐1 Matthews Estate ‐ 25219145.00 

 

 
 
Hello Rob, 
 
Attached please find the report files for job 500-200205-1; Matthews Estate - 25219145.00 
 

 This email originated from outside of SCS Engineers. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and 
know the content is safe. 
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Please feel free to contact me if you have any questions. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Sandie Fredrick 
Project Manager 
 
Eurofins TestAmerica, Chicago 
Phone: 920-261-1660 
 
E-mail: sandra.fredrick@eurofinset.com 
www.eurofinsus.com/env 
 

   
 
Reference: [500-599149] 
Attachments: 1 
 
 
 
 
> > Bank information has changed, please refer to remittance information on 
invoice. < < 


