
Willkom, Mae - DNR 

From: Willkom, Mae - DNR 
Sent: 
To: 

Monday, August 29, 2016 9:54 AM 
duescherd@gmail.com 

Subject: FW: Sidewalk 

Dean, 

Please proceed with hiring the concrete contractor to replace the entire sidewalk slab, as he suggested. You (i.e . the 
Village) may either pay him and send me a receipt for reimbursement, or send me the bill from the contractor, and I will 
see that he is paid directly. Thanks for taking care of this. 

Mae 

We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http ://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did . 

Mae E. Willkom 
Phone: 715-839-3748 
mae.willkom@wi.gov 

From: Willkom, Mae - DNR 
Sent: Thursday, August 25, 2016 4:25 PM 
To: duescherd@qmail.com 
Subject: Sidewalk 

Just wanted to let you know that my guy in Madison is out until Monday. I'll get back to you next week. Thanks. 

We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http ://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 

Mae E. Willkom 
Hydrogeologist-Remediation and Redevelopment 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources 
1300 W. Clairemont Ave., Eau Claire, WI 54701 
Phone: 715-839-3748 

Fax: 715-839-6076 
mae.willkom@wi.gov 
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