Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, May 29, 2018 9:50 AM

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

Subject: RE: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Due By: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 9:00 AM

Flag Status: Flagged

As we discussed in phone call:

Olynick will provide black dirt (5 yds for $110)
A couple local people offered to do the labor...I will pay them $10/hr...I am estimating 10 hrs x $10 x 2 people = $200

Total Estimate is $300

From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR [mailto:Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, May 29, 2018 6:44 AM

To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home

Thanks Ken, do you have a company name and quote from them?

We are committed to service excellence.
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how | did.

Carrie Stoltz
Phone (715)365-8942
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov

From: Ken Shimko [mailto:kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, May 25, 2018 12:03 PM

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>
Subject: RE: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home

Carrie.
| found some local folks who will help repairing the lawn at Cindy’s (see earlier emails).
Estimated Cost:

5 yds of Black dirt $110
Labor estimate $200.

So estimate repair cost to be $300.

Kenneth Shimko, PG



Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC
2711 North Elco Road

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742
(715)832-6608 (office)

(715)579-0723 (cell)

(715)832-6797 (Fax)

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com

From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR [mailto:Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, May 23, 2018 6:30 AM

To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home

Yes, | agree, pretty high. How about a landscaper?

We are committed to service excellence.
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how | did.

Carrie Stoltz
Phone (715)365-8942
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov

From: Ken Shimko [mailto:kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 22, 2018 6:38 PM

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>
Subject: FW: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home

Carrie.

Attached is quote | got from Olynick for repairing Cindy’s Lawn...I thought it was a little high...will see if | can get another
estimate

From: Ken Shimko [mailto:kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, May 20, 2018 11:18 AM

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>
Subject: FW: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home

| am seeking cost for lawn repair at Cindy’s place in Jump River...see below and attached

From: Ken Shimko [mailto:kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, May 20, 2018 11:15 AM

To: Chris Olynick <chrisolynick@gmail.com>

Subject: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home

Hi Chris.

As you know, we are drilling in Jump River at Cindy Piotrowski’s place. We are using an ATV rig with rubber tracks...but
we are leaving tracks especially when we turn (see attached).

Can you email me a price for fixing the lawn after we are finished?
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| am thinking:

e Top-dress and smooth out damaged area using black dirt...Might have to roll it??
e Lawn seed (probably a Starter Mix...???)

We should be done drilling this week...so can you repair right after Memorial Day? | need cost estimate first...
Thanks!

Kenneth Shimko, PG

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC
2711 North Elco Road

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742
(715)832-6608 (office)

(715)579-0723 (cell)

(715)832-6797 (Fax)

Email: kshimko.meridianenv(@gmail.com




Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>

Sent: Sunday, May 20, 2018 11:18 AM

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

Subject: FW: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home

Attachments: IMG_0879.JPG; IMG_0885.JPG; IMG_0886.JPG; IMG_0887.JPG

| am seeking cost for lawn repair at Cindy’s place in Jump River...see below and attached

From: Ken Shimko [mailto:kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com]
Sent: Sunday, May 20, 2018 11:15 AM

To: Chris Olynick <chrisolynick@gmail.com>

Subject: Lawn Repair - Cindy Piotrowski's home

Hi Chris.

As you know, we are drilling in Jump River at Cindy Piotrowski’s place. We are using an ATV rig with rubber tracks...but
we are leaving tracks especially when we turn (see attached).

Can you email me a price for fixing the lawn after we are finished?

| am thinking:

e Top-dress and smooth out damaged area using black dirt...Might have to roll it??
e Lawn seed (probably a Starter Mix...???)

We should be done drilling this week...so can you repair right after Memorial Day? | need cost estimate first...

Thanks!

Kenneth Shimko, PG

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LL.C
2711 North Elco Road

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742
(715)832-6608 (office)

(715)579-0723 (cell)

(715)832-6797 (Fax)

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com
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