Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, June 15, 2018 3:07 PM

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

Subject: JIM'S BAR - Jump River - Dry Weight cost (% Total Solids)
Attachments: 20180416075238989.pdf; 1840051673_inv.pdf

Carrie.

Please see attached invoice for recent soil sample analysis at Jims Bar.

We received DNR approval for PVOC+Naph testing in the April 13, 2018 Change Order (attached). However the lab is
also billing for Dry Weight (% Total Solids - U&C S24)(see attached invoice and email below).

This is new but | understand the lab’s position (see email exchange below).
Can you approve the additional cost?
Please advise.

Thanks!

Kenneth Shimko, PG

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LL.C
2711 North Elco Road

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742
(715)832-6608 (office)

(715)579-0723 (cell)

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com

From: Brian Basten [mailto:Brian.Basten@pacelabs.com]
Sent: Friday, June 15, 2018 2:53 PM

To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: FW: JIM'S BAR (Pace Project # 40169795)

Ken, for PECFA U & C projects, we are approved to charge $6.83 for total solids. We have not charged for this test in the
past in error. After it was brought to our attention, we began charging for the testing as allowed by the posted PECFA
U&C rates.

Please let me know if you have any further questions.

Thanks!



Brian Basten
Client Services Manager

Pace Analytical Services

1241 Bellevue St, STE 9
Green Bay, WI 54302

D-920.321.9411 | W-920.469.2436 | C-920.621.7219

www.pacelabs.com

>>> "Ken Shimko" <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 6/15/2018 2:46 PM >> >
>
Brian.

Can you explain the Dry Weight charge on this invoice? In the past we have only been charged for the PVOC+Naph
analysis.

| will forward your response to the DNR Proj. Mgr. for approval.

Thanks

Kenneth Shimko, PG

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LL.C
2711 North Elco Road

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742
(715)832-6608 (office)

(715)579-0723 (cell)

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com

From: Paceport Email Notification [mailto:brian.basten@pacelabs.com]
Sent: Friday, June 01, 2018 4:22 PM



To: brian.basten@pacelabs.com; kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com
Subject: JIM'S BAR (Pace Project # 40169795)

Paceport Login

Pace Automated Email Notification

This email contains EDDs and Reports generated by Paceport's automated deliverable service. The attached files
have been authorized to be sent to you due to the completion of project 40169795. Your Pace project manager
has been CC'ed on this email so that you may request any further assistance.

To access this project's page in paceport click on the following link.
http.//paceport. pacelabs.com/ClientPortal/mvc/projectDetails/modelAndView ?projectiD=40169795&systemID=lims40
Copyright © 2012 Pace Analytical Services, Inc




State of Wisconsin Scott Walker, Governor

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES Daniel L. Meyer, Secretary
Telephone 608-266-2621

107 Sutliff Ave
. . Toll Free 1-888-936-7463
Rhinelander, Wi 54501 TTY Access via relay - 711

- WISCONSIN
DEPT. OF NATURAL RESOURCES

April 13, 2018

Cinderella Piotrowski
W14764 State Hwy 73
Sheldon, WI 54766

RE: Public Bidding Deferred — Cost Cap Approved

PECFA # 54433-9769-64-A DNR BRRTS # 03-61-000116
Jim & Cindy's Bar, W14764 State Hwy 73, Gilman

-l

On April 11, 2018, the Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources (Department) received a scope of
work (SOW) and cost estimate utilizing the chapter NR 747, Wisconsin Administrative Code, Usual and
Customary Cost Schedule (Cost Schedule) for the site referenced above.

The Department has determined that the submitted SOW is reasonable and approves the additional
costs. This site will be deferred from the public bidding process at this time. The Department will contact

you if this site will be bid in the future.

This approval is for the installation of (7) new monitoring wells, and (2) rounds of groundwater sampling
(PVOC + Naphthalene) from the following wells: MW-1,2,3,5,6,7,8A, 8B,9A,9B,10A, 10B, seven new
wells, private wells (14789 STH 73-Keeper’s new private well (VOCs), Jim’s Bar, 8910 Elm, 8907 Birch,
8897 Birch, 8891 Bridge (Conv Store), 8890 Bridge, 14778 River, and 8887 Bridge. Nine (9) soil borings
with sampling (PVOC + Naphthalene), installation of (6) soil vapor extraction vents, waste disposal and a
letter report upon completion. A copy of the Department worksheet for the Cost Schedule tasks is

enclosed for your reference.
Deferment Cost Cap Approved: $51,835.05

Be reminded that ch. NR 700 semi-annual progress reporting is required until this case is closed.

Note: A claim for PECFA reimbursement must be submitted within 180 days of incurring costs (i.e.,
completing a task). If a claim for costs incurred is not submitted within this deadline, the costs will not be
eligible for PECFA reimbursement. If you need assistance with filing your claim, please contact Tim
Prosa at (608) 261-7715.

Usual and customary costs for activities included in this approval will only be reimbursed at a rate equal
to or less than what is allowed on the Cost Schedule, and are reimbursed based upon the Cost Schedule
that is in effect at the time the activity is performed. Costs for activities not included in this approval are
not reimbursable without prior Department authorization.

Regulatory Correspondence (Task 7, Activity RC05), Claim Submittal (Task 27, Activity CS05) and
Standardized Invoice (Task 28, Activity SI05) costs are not included in the cap approved above. These
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Cinderella Piotrowski 2 April 13,2018

activities will be reimbursed according to the task specifications and with submittal of proper supporting
documentation at claim review time.

The Department approves a variance from the Cost Schedule for costs associated with the
installation of a replacement private well for the Cal Keeper’s residence (14789 STH 73): including
connection to water supply, survey of property, and consultant coordination and supervision. Do
not include these costs ($9,108.00) on the standardized invoice for usual and customary cost activities.
Include these costs on a separate company invoice. When you submit the claim for these costs, please
attach a copy of this letter and the attached worksheet for the claim reviewer’s reference. The Department
waives the commodity three-bid requirement with this variance approval.

The Department considers the consultant the primary controller of costs during these activities. This
approval does not guarantee eligibility of any specific costs that have been incurred or that may be
incurred in the future. Final determination regarding the eligibility of costs will be made by the claim
reviewer when the entire claim, including all invoices and reports, is submitted for payment.

Thank you for your efforts to protect Wisconsin’s environment. If you have any questions, please contact
me in writing at the letterhead address or by telephone at (715) 365-8942.

Sincerely,

.H" ‘.!\ 1\
Carrie Stoltz
Hydrogeologist
Remediation and Redevelopment Program

Enclosure: Usual and Customary Cost Schedule Worksheet

¢t Ken Shimko-Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC



Usual & Customary Cost Schedule Worksheet #23 (January 2018 - July 2018) for Form RR-092a

PECFA#: 54433-9769-64
BRRTS #: 03-61-000116 Cost Schedule Total $42,727.05
Site Name: Jim & Cindy's Bar Variance Total $9,108.00
Site Address: W14764 STH 73, Gilman Grand Total $51,835.05
Date: April 13, 2018

Groundwater Sampling

Consutlant coordinations/supervision (Keepers PW install)

1 GS05 _|Sample Collection Well 58| 5 72458 4.202.10
1 |Groundwater Sampling G825  |Primary Mob/Demob Site 2| $ 628.11 1.256.22
4 |(Waste Disposal Consultant WD05 |Consultant Coordination Site 21 & 137.13( § 274.28
4 |Waste Disposal Commodity WD10  |Groundwater Sample and/or Purge Drum 5 § 42.11| $ 210.55
4 |Waste Disposal Commodity WD15 |Drill Cuttings Drum 20| % 108.15| $ 2,163.00
4 [Waste Disposal Commodity WD25  |Primary Mob/Demob Site 3 8 287.701 $ 863.10
6 |Letter Report/Addendum LRAO5 |Letter Report/Addendum Letter 1 $ 1,039.29| 8 1,039.29
10 |Initial Site Survey - Features and Well Elevations Consultant 1S10 | Subsequent Surveys Well 71 8 110.15] $ 771.05
Consultant Oversight Drilling in Unconsolidated Soils ~ . i}
13.a With Soil Sampling Consultant DROS  [For depth interval 0 - 25 ft bgs ft 255| $ 540 | $ 1.377.00
Consuitant Oversight Drilling in Unconsolidated Soils - .
13.a With Soil Sampling Consuitant DR10  [For depth interval 26 - 50 ft bgs ft 55| $ 5673 311.85
Consultant Oversight Drilling in Unconsolidated Soils - N i
13.a With Soil Sampling Consultant DR15  |For depth interval 51 - 75 ft bgs ft 10| $ 7301 8 73.00
Consultant Oversight Drilling in Unconsolidated Soiis - . g
132 With Soil Sampling Consultant DR20  |Primary Mob/Demob Site 118 593.04 | & 593.04
Consultant Oversight Drilling in Unconsolidated Soils - .

13.b Without Soif and/or Groundwater Sampling Consultant DR25 |Consultant Oversight ft 115| $ 1.58 | § 181.70

13.d | Drilling in Unconsolidated Soils - With Soil Sampling Commodity DR45 0 - 251t bgs ft 2551 $ -1670 | § 4,258.50

13.d | Drilling in Unconsolidated Soils - With Soil Sampling Commodity DRS50 26 - 50 ft bgs ft 55| § 18.38 | $ 1,010.90

13.d | Drilling in Unconsolidated Soils - With Soil Sampling Commodity DRS55 | 51-75ftbgs ft 101 § 2153 | § 215.30

Drilling in Unconsclidated Soils - Without Soil and/or . e s . .

13.e Groundwater Sampling Commodity DR60  [Drilling in Unconsolidated Soils 118] $ 119718 1,376.55
14 |Monitoring Well installation - Consultant Oversight Consultant | MWIO5 | 0-25ft bgs 1t 2951 $ 38918 1,147.55 | inlcudes (8) SVE wells 20’ each
14 |Monitoring Well Installation - Consultant Qversight Consultant MWI10 | 2675t bgs ft 80| $ 27318 218.40
14 |Monitoring Well Instaliation Commodity | MWI15 |2 inch PVC Casing ft 375 § 16.70 | 3 6,262.50 | includes (6) SVE wells 20' each
14 |Monitoring Well Instaliation Commeodity | MWI20 [Well Development Well 7| % 14763 | $ 1,033.41
14 |Monitoring Well Installation Commodity | MWI25 |Mob/Demob (For development of grout or slurry sealed wells) Site 1% 54863 | $ 548.63
15 |Miscellaneous Drilling Activities and Supplies MDTOS |Drill Rig Mob/Demob (includes decontaminatlon) Mob/Demob 118 963.38 | $ 963.38
15 (Miscellaneous Drilling Activities and Supplies MDT10 |Well Cover/fflushmount Each 13| § 2028651 8 2.634.45 includes (6) SVE well covers

: e - . Commaodity service provider (drilling & direct push) Per Diem (includes
15 |Miscellaneous Drilling Activities and Supplies MDT25 meals and ovemight stay per person, maximum of 2 persons) Each 121 $ 20328 | $ 2,439.36
15 |Miscellaneous Drilling Activities and Supplies MDT35 |Borehole Abandonment it 180{ $ 5461 8 982.80
15 |Miscellaneous Drilling Activities and Supplies MDT41  [Private Utility Locate Each 118 11718 | 8 11718
20 |Soil Boring/Monitoring Well Permits SBMWPOS | Soil Boring/Monitoring Well Permit Permit 2l % 24612 | § 492.24
31 |Consultant Qvernight Per Diem COPDO05 |Overnight Night 8| % 113.72 682.32
33 Water Sample| Laboratory W4 PVOQC + Naphthalene Sample 56| § 30.35 1,699.60
33 Water Sample| Laboratory W20  |VOC Method 524.2 Sample 2| $ 176.30 | 352.60
33 Soil Sample| Laboratory S6 PVOC + Naphthalene Sample 72| § 36.02 2,593.44
36 |Change Order Request CORO0S5  |Change Order Request Change Order 1% 381.78 | $ 381.78
Variance Commodity to install replacement PW (Keepers) 1 $5,800.00 $5,800.00
Variance Commodity to connect new PW (Keepers) to house supply 1 $800.00 $800.00
Variance Survey Keeper's property boundaries 1 $1,200.00 $1,200.00
Variance

1 $1,308.00 $1,308.00



I NVO I C E Pace Analytical Services, LLC
1241 Bellevue Street - Suite 9

Green Bay, Wi 54302

Phone: (920)469-2436

ace Analytical

www.pacelabs.com

Invoice Number: 1840051673
Date: 06/01/2018
Total Amount Due: $2,699.55

Sold To: Please Remit To:
Kenneth Shimko : :
Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC ga(;eBﬁzagng; é Services, LLC

2711 North Elco Rd
Fall Creek, WI 54742
715-832-6608

Chicago, IL 60695-4056

__ ClientNumber/ClientID |  PurchaseOrderNo |  PaceProjectMgr |  Terms*
40-000718 / Meridian Env Brian Basten Net 30 Days
Client Project: JIM'S BAR Client Name: Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC
Pace Praoject No: 40169795 Sample Received: 5/25/2018
Report Sent To: Kenneth Shimko, Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC
Comments:
ANALYTICAL CHARGES
Quantity Unit Description ' Method Matrix Price Total
63 Ea  Dry Weight ASTM D2974-87 Solid $6.83 $430.29
63 Ea  WIGRO Solid WI MOD GRO Solid $36.02 $2,269.26
Analytical Subtotal $2,699.55
Total Number of Charges 126 Total Invoice Amount $2,699.55

If you have any questions, please contact Brian Basten at Pace.
Phone: (920)469-2436 Email: brian.basten@pacelabs.com

Page 1 of 1
**1.5% MONTHLY FINANCE CHARGE ASSESSED AFTER 30 DAYS OR TERMS OF CONTRACT.

PLEASE REFERENCE THE INVOICE NUMBER ON ALL REMITTANCE ADVICE.

AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY EMPLOYER
Please complete and return copy of invoice with your payment.
INVOICE TOTAL $2,699.55

Amount Paid:  $

Check No:

Customer No: 40-000718 Invoice No: 1840051673



