
Stoltz, CarrieR- DNR 

From: 
Sent: 

Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com > 
Tuesday, April 21, 2020 11 :06 AM 

To: Stoltz, CarrieR - DNR 
Subject: 
Attachments: 

Lawn Repair costs during well abandonment 
IMG_0878.JPG; IMG_0879.JPG; IMG_0885.JPG 

Follow Up Flag: Follow up 
Due By: 

Flag Status: 
Wednesday, April 22, 2020 6:30 AM 
Completed 

Carrie. 

Please recall that we left tracks when we installed monitoring wells (see attached pictures and email string below). 

I expect we will do the same when we abandon wells. 

Can you please approve cost to repair the expected lawn damage? I estimate same cost as before ... $300 
(see below). 

Thanks 

Kenneth Shimko, PG 
Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC 
2 711 North Elco Road 
Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742 
(715)832-6608 (office) 
(715)579-0723 (cell) 
Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com 

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, May 25, 2018 12:03 PM 
To: 'Stoltz, CarrieR- DNR' <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: RE: Lawn Repair- Cindy Piotrowski's home 

Carrie. 

I found some local folks who will help repairing the lawn at Cindy's (see earlier emails) . 

Estimated Cost: 

5 yds of Black dirt $110 
Labor estimate $200. 

So estimate repair cost to be $300. 
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Stoltz, CarrieR- DNR 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
Subject: 
Attachments: 

Follow Up Flag: 
Due By: 
Flag Status: 

Please see attached. 

Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com > 
Tuesday, April 21, 2020 10:29 AM 
Stoltz, CarrieR- DNR 
RE: Jump River- concrete patch of water line hole- $175 
Concrete repair of floor in Store.xlsx 

Follow up 
Wednesday, April 22, 2020 6:30 AM 
Completed 

From: Stoltz, Carrie R- DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin .gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 21, 2020 8:36AM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE : Jump River- concrete patch of water line hole- $175 

HI Ken, I will just need a written estimate from the concrete guy. An email from him is fine too 

We are committed to service excellence. 

Visit our survey at http ://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 

Carrie Stoltz 
Phone (715}365-8942 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin .gov 

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 21, 2020 8:34AM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R- DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: Jump River- concrete patch of water line hole- $175 

Hi Carrie . 

We installed the water line for the new Store well yesterday (20th) . 

We horizontal drilled from the well to beneath the Store floor ... coming up through the floor. 

Our original plan was to connect outside but due to owner's concerns and buried utilities, this was the better 
alternative. 

The concrete floor needs to be patched . I have a local concrete guy who can patch it for $175. 

Can you please approve $175 for repairing (patching) the concrete floor? 

Thanks 

Kenneth Shimko, PG 
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Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC 
2711 North Elco Road 
Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742 
(715)832-6608 (office) 
(715)579-0723 (cell) 
Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com 
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Shawn McNamar Statement Date: 
Date Due: 

Ken Shimko 

Meridian Environmental Consulting llC 

DATE DESCRIPTION CHARGES CREDITS 

Repair concrete hole which consists of 

04/20/2020 plastic, foam, pin rods, materials supplied U75.oo 

Total Due: 

04/20/2020 

Upon Receipt 

ACCOUNT BALANCE 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5 .00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 

$1.]5.00 



Stoltz, CarrieR- DNR 

From: 
Sent: 

Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com > 
Tuesday, April 21, 2020 8:49 AM 

To: Stoltz, Carrie R- DNR 
Subject: Change Order: (Jump River): Abandon (grout) SVE piping - 750 feet (estimated): 

$300/hr x 8 hours (estimated) = $2400 

Carrie. 

Per your email string below, I contacted the driller about abandoning the SVE piping at Jump River (estimate 750 feet of 
SVE piping). The driller estimated the additional time in email below. 

Please approve the additional cost ($2400) to abandon/grout the SVE piping. 

Thanks 

Kenneth Shimko, PG 
Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC 
2711 North Elco Road 
Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742 
(715)832-6608 (office) 
(715)579-0723 (cell) 
Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com 

From: Jeffrey Manninen <jeffrey.manninen@intertek.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, April 21, 2020 8:36AM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: [External] FW: Abandon monitoring wells and grout SVE piping 

Ken, 

We can perform the additional work on an hourly basis. I'm estimating that it will take 8 hours, but that's probably on 

the high end. 

__ 8__ hours x $ 300.00 /hour= Cost $2,400.00 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

Thanks, 

Jeff Manninen 
Branch Manager 
Building & Construction 
lntertek-PSI 

Office 715.738.2770 
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Email Jeffrey.manninen@intertek.com 
www.intertek.com/building 

lntertek-PSI, 12839 301
h Avenue, Chippewa Falls, WI 54729 

From: Stoltz, Carrie R- DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Sent: Friday, April 03, 2020 2:49 PM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE : Jim's Bar closure decision 

Hi Ken, I spoke with Chris. He said the piping/ect should be grouted to fill/seal the piping as much as possible. 

We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvev to evaluate how I did. 

Carrie Stoltz 
Phone (715)365-8942 
Ca rrie .Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, April 03, 2020 12:25 PM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R- DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: RE: Jim's Bar closure decision 

What is needed for abandoning SVE piping? I am thinking cut below grade and cap. Or does Northern Region require 
filling with grout?? 

Thanks 

From: Stoltz, CarrieR- DNR <Carrie .Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Sent: Friday, April 03, 2020 8:34AM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE : Jim's Bar closure decision 

You can remove it and abandon the MWs. This site was just paused. 

We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi .gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 

Carrie Stoltz 
Phone (715)365-8942 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 
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From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Sent: Friday, April 03, 2020 8:03AM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R- DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: RE : Jim's Bar closure decision 

Should we leave the SVE system in place for now? Or should we remove it? 

From: Stoltz, Carrie R- DNR <Carrie .Stoltz@wisconsin .gov> 
Sent: Friday, April 03, 2020 7:06AM 

To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: Jim's Bar closure decision 

Hi Ken, yesterday the NOR Closure Committee reviewed Jim's Bar and paused the site until the following items are 

submitted. If you have any questions, please feel free to give me a call. Thanks, Carrie 

• A notification for GW contamination should be sent to 14767 Hwy 73 (MW-6). You will probably need a cost 

request and I can place a note in Tracker 

• The GW plume should be drawn to include Keeper's and the Convenience Store 

• At least one figure should show that Keeper's is a shared well 

• Please explain the hydrologic conditions. Why does GW flow east and west? The concern here is why does the 
plume impact Keepers and the Convenience Store? I have attached David Swimm's maps/notes for you review 

Upon resubmittal of these items, the site can be fast tracked. 

We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 

Carrie Stoltz 
Hydrogeologist-Remediation and Redevelopment, EM Division 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources 
107 Sutliff Avenue, Rhinelander, WI 54501 
Phone: {715)365-8942 {for Voicemail) 
Temporary Cell : {715) 360-9161 
Fax: {715)365-8932 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 
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