From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

Sent: Thursday, June 04, 2020 7:42 PM
To: Ken Shimko
Subject: RE: Jump River well abandonment invoice-APPROVED!

Hi Ken, this email serves as your approval for the costs listed below. A note will be placed in Tracker
under the original approval, dated April 22, 2020. Please submit this email with your claim. If you have
any questions, let me know. Thanks, Carrie

Commodity is requesting a per diem (2) men at $209.38 each for a total of #418.76 *came back a 2™
day

Commodity is requesting (3) additional hours of grouting at $300.00/hr for a total of $900.00

Total cost request is $1,318.76

We are committed to service excellence.
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did.

Carrie Stoltz
Phone (715)365-8942
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 02, 2020 3:37 PM

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>
Subject: Jump River well abandonment invoice

Importance: High

Carrie.

| received attached invoice for well abandonment at Jump River.
Note that there are two charges that need your approval.

Per Diem

The work was completed on 5/6 and 5/22. The contractor requested overnite Per Diem for the crew (of
2).

Grouting SVE piping

PSl invoiced for 11 hours of grouting...the original estimate was 8 hours. Please approve the 3 additional
hours.

Thanks


http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey

Kenneth Shimko, PG

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC
2711 North Elco Road

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742
(715)832-6608 (office)

(715)579-0723 (cell)

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com
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