
From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR 
Sent: Monday, June 08, 2020 10:04 AM 
To: 'Ken Shimko' 
Subject: Jim's Bar: New Well at Convenience Store: Sediment Filters-APPROVED! 
 
HI Ken, this email serves as an approval for the Commodity costs of $ 203.06   to replace the sediment 
filters at the Convenience Store (8891 Bridge Rd)  due to sediment build-up from the new well 
installation.  A note will be placed in Tracker under the original approval for the well replacement dated 
October 7, 2019.  Please submit this email approval with your claim.  If you have any questions, let me 
know.  Thanks, Carrie 
 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 
 

Carrie Stoltz 
Phone (715)365-8942 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 

 

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>  
Sent: Sunday, June 07, 2020 12:27 PM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: RE: Jump River: New Well at Store: Sediment Filters 
 
Carrie. 
 
Look what showed up in the mail yesterday… Romig’s invoice for replacement of filters which were 
clogged due to new well hookup.   
 
Please approve. 
 
Thanks 
 
 
Kenneth Shimko, PG 

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC 

2711 North Elco Road 

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742 

(715)832-6608 (office) 

(715)579-0723 (cell) 

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com 

 
 
 

From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>  
Sent: Friday, May 15, 2020 6:32 AM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Jump River: New Well at Store: Sediment Filters 
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Thanks, I noticed I had an email from you and wanted you to get reimbursed.  
 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 
 

Carrie Stoltz 
Phone (715)365-8942 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 

 

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2020 5:17 PM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: RE: Jump River: New Well at Store: Sediment Filters 
 
I did not… I requested from plumber several times.   
 

From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>  
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2020 4:59 PM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Jump River: New Well at Store: Sediment Filters 
 
Hi Ken, did you ever receive the sediment invoice? See below 
 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 
 

Carrie Stoltz 
Phone (715)365-8942 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 

 

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>  
Sent: Saturday, April 25, 2020 6:34 AM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: Jump River: New Well at Store: Sediment Filters 
 
Carrie. 
 
This note follows our phone conversation yesterday morning in which we discussed the new well at the 
Country Store in Jump River.  Please recall the new well was hooked up on Tuesday (21st).  The Store 
contacted me Thursday afternoon and said the water pressure (flow rate) was very low.  I contacted the 
well driller and the plumber who returned to check the system Friday morning.  They determined the 
sediment filters we installed before the carbon filter unit had clogged due to the new well.  This issue 
will decrease as the well is pumped.  The plumber replaced the sediment filters which fixed the problem. 
 
I will receive an invoice from the plumber for the sediment filters and labor.  I will let you know how 
much that is…I am guessing it will be about $250 (?).   
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Thanks  
 
Kenneth Shimko, PG 

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC 

2711 North Elco Road 

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742 

(715)832-6608 (office) 

(715)579-0723 (cell) 

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com 
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