
From: Dave Larsen <dlarsen@reiengineering.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, May 28, 2019 10:54 AM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR 
Subject: Moose Junction - ROW well abandonment 
Attachments: 6510 ROW potable abandonment.pdf 
 
Cost proposal for the proper abandonment of the former potable water supply well located in the 
WISDOT right of way of State Highway 35.  Following the installation of MW’s 9 and 10, the former 
potable well was no longer integral to the investigation.   
 
Thank you, 

David N. Larsen P.G 
Senior Hydrogeologist / Professional Geologist 
 

 

Connect with us :    

 
Confidentiality Notice: This message is intended for the recipient only.  If you have received this e-mail in error please disregard. 
 



PECFA #: 54830-9999-97 Vendor Name: REI

BRRTS #: 03-16-000301 Invoice #: 381.78$           

Site Name: Moose Junction Lounge Invoice Date: Proposal Date 5/14/19 200.00$           

Site Address: 13195 S Hwy 35, Dairyland Check #: 581.78$           

TASK TASK DESCRIPTION SERVICES
ACTIVITY 

CODE
ACTIVITY REFERENCE CODE DESCRIPTION UNIT

 MAX UNIT 

COST 
UNITS

 TOTAL 

MAX 

36 Change Order Request COR05 Change Order Request (cost cap exceedance requests) Change Order 381.78$               1 381.78$           

Variance Properly seal abandoned potable water supply well in WISDOT right of way (Chell Well Drilling Proposal) Variance 200.00$               1 200.00$           

U&C Total

Variance to U&C Total

Grand Total

Usual and Customary Standardized Invoice #25

January 2019 - June 2019
RR-107a



From: David Chell <dj_chell@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2019 12:07 PM 

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR 

Subject: [WARNING: ATTACHMENT(S) MAY CONTAIN MALWARE]Filling and Sealing 
Invoice 

Attachments: DNR.doc 

 

Moose Junction; listed the Owner as Wisconsin DOT.  Filed report pending. 

 

Dave 

 

 

Virus-free. www.avast.com  

 



 

21 May 2019 Invoice 

 

DNR 

c/o Carrie Stoltz 

 

re:  Moose Junction Fill and Seal 

 

Item Qua

ntity 

UM Price/ 

Unit 

Total Price 

Holeplug, 3/8" 2 Ea 15 30.00 

Well Abandonment Labor 1 Ea 150 150.00 

Paperwork Filing 1 Ea 20 20.00 

     

     

     

     

     

     

     

     

     

     

     

     

     

     

Total Cost:    $200.00 

     

Amount Owed:    $200.00 

We thank you greatly for your upcoming payment.  Checks can be made payable to 

“Chell Well Drilling” and sent to the address at the top of the page.  Feel free to call with 

any questions you may have concerning the well.   

 

Thank you,  

 

 

Dave Chell 

Chell Well Drilling Co. 
 1471 345th Ave.  Frederic, WI  54837 

(715) 327-8665 

 



Chell Well Drilling  


