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Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, February 21, 2018 9:06 AM
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR
Subject: Change Order to thaw Vent Pipes frosted closed/restricted at Autostop/Dougs
Attachments: Chg Order Steam frozen pipes.pdf

Carrie. 
 
Here is Chg Order to steam the frozen pipes at Autostop/Dougs.  Cost from plumber (Ron Young) in email below.   
 
As we discussed in previous emails, airflow in the pipes is restricted due to frost buildup.  Several pipes are frosted shut 
(e.g., EX-2, EX-5, RW-3) or restricted (M-1).   
 
Normally I would wait until spring thaw but David Swimm requested data comparing SVE discharge versus ground water 
levels.  To obtain this data, we need the pipes thawed.   
 
I will combine the work with a regular site maintenance trip (in next few days if approval is forthcoming). 
 
Please contact me with questions. 
 
Thanks 
 
Kenneth Shimko, PG 
Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC 
2711 North Elco Road 
Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742 
(715)832-6608 (office) 
(715)579-0723 (cell) 
(715)832-6797 (Fax) 
Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com 
 
 
 

From: Rachel Young [mailto:ryoung2phe@yahoo.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, February 21, 2018 7:38 AM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: Vent Pipes frosted closed/restricted at Autostop/Dougs 
 
To steam frozen pipes at Verizon store $600.00 
 
 
On Wednesday, February 14, 2018, 2:51:34 PM CST, Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> wrote:  
 
 

Hi Ron. 
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I would like to hire you to steam the piping at the Verizon (former Autostop).  But, as you can see from Carrie’s email 
below, I need to get a quote from you. 

  

Can you email me a quote?  Call my cell 715-579-0723 with questions.   

  

Would like to do this work in next week or so. 

  

Thanks!! 

  

Kenneth Shimko, PG 

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC 

2711 North Elco Road 

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742 

(715)832-6608 (office) 

(715)579-0723 (cell) 

(715)832-6797 (Fax) 

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com 

  

  

From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR [mailto:Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov]  
Sent: Wednesday, February 14, 2018 11:18 AM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Vent Pipes frosted closed/restricted at Autostop/Dougs 

  

Hi Ken, please submit an itemized quote from a plumber and cost request.  Thanks, Carrie 

  

We are committed to service excellence. 

Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 

  

Carrie Stoltz 
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Phone (715)365-8942 

Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 



Usual and Customary Standardized Invoice #22 
July 2017 - December 2017 

PECFA #: 54848-1215-11/-1295-19 
BRRT's #: 03-55-000408/-282548 

Site Name: Dougs/Autostop 
Site Address : -=L=a-=-dyt....:.s:..:..:m..:..:.it:::..h:.__ ____ _ 

36 Change Order Request 

VendorName : ~C~h_a_n~g_e~O~r~d~er~----------------------­
lnvoice #: Change Order 

Invoice Date: February21 , 2018 
Check #: Change Order 

COR05 Change Order Request (cost cap exceedance requests) 

Variance 

Variance 

Steam Frozen pipes per Plumber Bid (Ron Young) 
Change Order $ 

~ 
-~~ 

(~~ 
~ 
RR-083A 

U&C Total $ 

Variance to U&C Total $ 

Grand Total $ 

381.78 1 $ 

$ 

381 .78 

600.00 

981 .78 

381 .78 

600.00 


