
From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR 
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 8:07 PM 
To: Ken Shimko 
Subject: Webster Pig Farm MW abandonment cost request-APPROVED! 
 
HI Ken, this email serves as your approval to use the MW abandonment costs previously on October 11, 
2019 for upcoming MW abandonment at the Webster Pig Farm site. These costs were never claimed. A 
note will be placed in Tracker in the original approval.   Please submit this email approval with your 
claim.  If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me.  Thanks, Carrie 
 
 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 
 

Carrie Stoltz 
Phone (715)365-8942 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 

 

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 1:40 PM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: RE: Webster Pig Farm can aband all MWs Thnx EOM 
 
We have two approvals for well abandonment: 
 

• 10/11/19 – Mob + abandon all wells (520 ft) 

• 6/8/20 – Mob + abandon select wells (335 ft)(this has been completed and invoice submitted to 
PECFA) 

 
If you approve, I can use 10/11/19 Change Order/Approval to abandon remaining MWs. 
 
Please email approval and I will abandon before 6/30/2020. 
 
Thanks 
 
Kenneth Shimko, PG 

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC 

2711 North Elco Road 

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742 

(715)832-6608 (office) 

(715)579-0723 (cell) 

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com 

 
 
 
 

From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>  
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 1:25 PM 

http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey
mailto:kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com
mailto:Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov


To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Webster Pig Farm can aband all MWs Thnx EOM 
 
You should have one for all mws-right? 
 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 
 

Carrie Stoltz 
Phone (715)365-8942 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 

 

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 1:22 PM 
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov> 
Subject: RE: Webster Pig Farm can aband all MWs Thnx EOM 
 
Thanks…I will send quick Change Order 
 

From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>  
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2020 1:20 PM 
To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com> 
Subject: Webster Pig Farm can aband all MWs Thnx EOM 
Importance: High 
 
 
 

 
We are committed to service excellence. 
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how I did. 

 
Carrie Stoltz 

Hydrogeologist-Remediation and Redevelopment, EM Division 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources 
107 Sutliff Avenue, Rhinelander, WI 54501 
Phone: (715)365-8942 (for Voicemail) 
Temporary Cell: (715) 360-9161 
Fax: (715)365-8932 
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov 
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