Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

From: Ron Anderson <rona@metcohg.com>
Sent: Wednesday, December 19, 2018 3:08 PM
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

Cc: pete raspolic; Jason Powell

Subject: RE:

Carrie...

| received this email today concerning Neps Bar. They would like costs approved to replace the electrical line
between the building and beer sign per it being disconnected per the remedial excavation project.

| know you have considered this issue before, but based on this info would it be possible for the pecfa fund to
cover the costs of replacing this electrical line?

Can you please respond to all...thanks!! ron

Ron Anderson PG

METCO - Senior Hydrogeologist
rona@metcohg.com / 608.781.8879

709 Gillette Street - Suite 3, La Crosse WI 54603
www.metcohg.com

From: pete raspolic <praspolic@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, December 19, 2018 2:54 PM
To: Ron Anderson <rona@metcohq.com>
Subject:

Ron:

The following is a blue print of Nep’s tavern in Moquah WI. It show the underground buried power line to the grain belt
sign.

After dirt work was completed sign no longer worked. Sign is good just no power to it.

Pete.

Sent from Mail for Windows 10
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Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

_ ==
From: Ron Anderson <rona@metcohg.com>
Sent: Wednesday, December 05, 2018 8:24 AM
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR
Subject: FW: Neps Bar Moquah WI.
Attachments: 20180524_105235_001_1527254347783[489].jpg; Neps ljpg; kenny letter.jpg; Nepslljpg

Here is the email from June that | sent.

thanks!! ron

Ron Anderson PG

METCO - Senior Hydrogeologist
rona@metcohq.com / 608.781.8879

709 Gillette Street - Suite 3, La Crosse WI 54603
www.metcohg.com

From: Ron Anderson

Sent: Thursday, June 14, 2018 9:52 AM

To: DNR - Carrie Stoltz (carrie.stoltz@wi.gov) <carrie.stoltz@wi.gov>
Subject: FW: Neps Bar Moquah WI.

Good morning...
This is per our emails on May 22nd about damage at the Neps Bar per the excavation project.
The attached pictures are from our client and an estimate for repairs is below.

We can send a Cost Cap Exceedence request, but wanted to get your feedback prior to putting it together.
thanks!! ron

Ron Anderson

METCO - Senior Hydrogeologist
rona@metcohq.com / 608.781.8879

709 Gillette Street - Suite 3, La Crosse WI 54603
www.metcohg.com

From: pete raspolic <praspolic@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 13, 2018 6:23 PM
To: Ron Anderson <rona@metcohg.com>
Subject: Neps Bar Moquah WI.

Hi Ron:

Copy of letter from Ken Kmetz as status of Neps Bar Power sign and driveway.
Also topsoil in low spot. The following is a cost appraisal of time and materials.
Direct Burial Wire ------------------ 222.00



Trencher 200.00

Labor 400.00

Total--------------- 822.00
1 load class 5 gravel

315

3yds topsoil 150
Compact track loader ---------- 420
Mob and demobilize--------------- 300
Labor 400
Seed and fertilizer ---------------- 100
Total 1685.0

Thanks
Pete Raspolic
Sent from Mail for Windows 10



