Vitale, Matthew J - DNR

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>

Thursday, August 16, 2018 5:17 AM

Rozeboom, David B - DNR; Vitale, Matthew J - DNR

‘Gary Gilbert'

RE: Julson Store Remedial Excavation - Field Report (Day 2) (BRRTS No. 0306001296) &
REQUEST APPROVAL FOR 100 MORE TONS (addition to 8-14-18 request)

Remaining Soil to be excavated.jpg; Excavation 8-15-18.pdf

This email is to request approval for another 100 tons (additional to yesterday’s request).

Yesterday (8-15-18) we continued soil excavation at former Julson Store site.

As you can see from the attached site map and picture, we are reaching the end of the excavation. We have additional
soil remaining to be excavated from the northeastern corner of the excavation.

Our tonnage total reached approximately 540 tons at the end of the day yesterday. That leaves roughly 3 loads under
the current budget (500 tons original + 100 tons = 600 tons). | am not sure 3 loads will be enough (see picture)? | would

like to request approval for an additional 100 tons to allow us to complete the excavation. This should do it and we
expect to finish today. The additional tonnage will be invoiced at unit rates as described in the approved Change Order.

Please email approval. You can call my cell 715-579-0723 ... reception is spotty so leave message and | can move to high

ground and return call.

Thanks for your help as we complete this remedial excavation.

Kenneth Shimko, PG

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC

2711 North Elco Road

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742
(715)832-6608 (office)
(715)579-0723 (cell)

Email: kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com

From: Rozeboom, David B - DNR [mailto:David.Rozeboom @wisconsin.gov]

Sent: Wednesday, August 15, 2018 6:30 AM

To: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>; Vitale, Matthew J - DNR <Matthew.Vitale@wisconsin.gov>

Cc: Gary Gilbert <ggilbert@izoom.net>

Subject: RE: Julson Store Remedial Excavation - Field Report (Day 1) (BRRTS No. 0306001296) & REQUEST APPROVAL

FOR 100 MORE TONS

Ken,



The request to excavate an additional 100 Tons of soil is approved if necessary to remove additional highly impacted
soil.

Thank you for the advance request.

We are committed to service excellence.
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how | did.

Dave Rozeboom

West Central Region Team Supervisor
Remediation and Redevelopment Program
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources
Phone: 715-839-3710
David.Rozeboom@wisconsin.gov

b dnr.wi.gov

BE&E

From: Ken Shimko <kshimko.meridianenv@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, August 14, 2018 7:49 PM

To: Vitale, Matthew J - DNR <Matthew.Vitale@wisconsin.gov>

Cc: Rozeboom, David B - DNR <David.Rozeboom@wisconsin.gov>; Gary Gilbert <ggilbert@izoom.net>

Subject: Julson Store Remedial Excavation - Field Report (Day 1) (BRRTS No. 0306001296) & REQUEST APPROVAL FOR
100 MORE TONS

Hi Matt.

C: Dave Rozeboom (I am copying Dave R. in case you are out of the office)
Gary Gilbert — Project Environmental Engineer

Bc: John Marum — property owner

Today, we began the remedial soil excavation at the former Julson Store site (W125 CTH Z, Mondovi). See attached
pictures and site map for reference.

We excavated 250 tons (approx.) of impacted soil today. We plan to return tomorrow to continue excavating impacted
soil.

The budget estimate was 500 tons. However, we ran into a couple of issues in the field which may increase the amount
of soil that should be excavated.

1. Found 2 tanks
We found 2 tanks (see attached site map and pictures). Advanced Tank assisted with the removal, cleaning, and

disposal of the tanks (a 500 gallon and a 750 gallon tank).

The presence of these 2 tanks combined with the tank removed initially (in 1994) explains the significant impacts
encountered in the soil borings and ground water.

It is possible we might encounter more tanks (I have seen it before at these old sites).

2. May exceed budget of 500 tons



As you might expect, the soil under the 2 tanks (which had obvious holes) was heavily impacted. The water
table is over a foot deeper (due to dry conditions). This allowed us to excavate deeper into the smear zone (to
about 14 feet beneath the former tanks)....which was good.

This additional depth produced more soil (tonnage) than planned. At this time, we might be fine with the
current budget of 500 tons ...based on field estimates. But | am requesting approval for another 100 tons in
case we run into more soil. The additional tonnage would be invoiced at unit rates as described in the Change
Order.

| have poor cell service at the site...but if you want to contact me, please call (cell 715-579-0723) and leave a
message. Or email...will come straight to my cell phone.

Thanks

Kenneth Shimko, PG

Meridian Environmental Consulting, LLC
2711 North Elco Road

Fall Creek, Wisconsin 54742
(715)832-6608 (office)

(715)579-0723 (cell)

Email: kshimko.meridianenv(@gmail.com




