





State of Wisconsin i
Department of Natural Resouroes Dry Cleaner Environmental Response Program

Box 7921, Madison, Wl §3707-7921 Interim and Remedial Action Bid Proposals Summary
’ Form 4400-212 (R 4/04) Page 1 of 2
Notice: This form is authorized under s. 292.65, Wis. Stals., and ch. MR 169, Wis, Adm. Ccde. The following information about the selection of

consultants for interim acticns, site investigations, and remedial action activities is required under ch. NR 169, Wis. Adm. Code. There are no penaities
for failing to complete this form, but persons who do not complete and submit this form will not be eligible for reimbursement under this program.
Personal information is not intended to be used for any other purpose other than that for which it is eriginally being collected. Information will be made
available to requesters under Wisconsin's Open Records laws (s. 19.32-19.39, Wis. Stats.) and requirements.

Instructions: Complete this form and attach a copy of the accepted signed bid, See reverse side for detailed instructions. Copy this form as
necessary.

Applicant Information

Applicant Name Business Name
Ehrlich Family Limited Partnership
Dry Cleaning Facility Name Location
Former Express Cleaners 3921-3942 N. Main St., Racine, Wi
Consultant Information
Bid Proposal Consultant Selected
Consultant Name Amount (select one)
Avanttli Environmental Group $470,398 D
Ramboll Environ $358,300
Terracon Consultants, Inc $176,009
$273,195

Huntoon Environmental Consulting, LLC
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If this summary is being provided as part of a reimbursement application, did your actual costs exceed the proposal costs by more than $3,000 or
5% of the original estimate (whichever is larger).

D Yes No

If yes, send a copy of he acepted amendment, signed by the DNR project manager.
Certification

I certify that the information contained above is true and correct to the best of my knowledge.
Applicant Signature &\ Date Signed

Wuavesh tkih Yy 3.5
Department Use Only
Project Manager Signature Date Telephone Number
" |Consultant Sefecticn Reason For Rejection/Notes
I:l Accepted D Rejected
















Bill Scott

From: Bill Scott

Sent: Tuesday, June 02, 2015 11:54 AM

To: Lori Huntoon

Cc: 'Ryan, Nancy D - DNR'

Subject: Former Express Cleaners, Racine Wis.
Lori —

| reviewed your proposal. | note that the cost is unclear to me, because two of your tables seem to have
different totals. I believe | know the intended cost but for the sake of clarity, I ask that you please review your
cost tables and then send me an email to either explain why the tables in your proposal are correct or email
me a revision with a short explanation of what was changed and why. If you attach any corrected table(s),
please put a revision date on them. Please do this at your earliest convenience. Please copy Nancy Ryan on
your email to me.

Thank you,
Bill.

Bill Scott

GONZALEZ Partner

SAGGIO

111 E. Wisconsin Ave,, Suite 1000 | Milwaukee, WI | 53202
i HARLANYE  1:(414) 277-8500 | F: (414) 277-8521

Attorneys at Lavs Profile | E-Mail | Website | Newsletter | Offices



Bill Scott

From: Lori Huntoon [lorihuntoonpg@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, June 08, 2015 2:59 PM
- To: Bill Scott
Cc: Nancy D - DNR Ryan
Subject: Fwd: budget form
Attachments: Form 4400-214d.xls; ATT00001.htm
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: Red Category
Bill:

Attached is the corrected form 4400-214d.

There is no change in the budget other than the following: I have removed the handling charges from the
subcontractor fees, and have itemized the costs for project expenses/WDNR fees.

There has been no change to the scope.

I trust this provides the clarification you need. Please let me know if you need any additional information.

Best regards,
Lori

Lori Huntoon, PG
Huntoon Environmental Consulting
608-886-7245












