From: Dave Larsen <dlarsen@reiengineering.com>

Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2019 9:50 AM
To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR

Subject: RE: Greater Bass

Attachments: system shut down and closure.pdf

Revised costs to include closure package and well abandonment

Thank you,
David N. Larsen P.G
Senior Hydrogeologist / Professional Geologist

David N. Larsen, P.G.
Senior Hydrogeologist
Dlarsen@RElengineering.com

CIVIL & ENVIRONMENTAL
ENCGINEERING, SURVEYING
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Wausau, WI 54401 715-675-9784

REIengineering.com Cell: 715-551-3434

Fax: 715-675-4060
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From: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2019 9:19 AM

To: Dave Larsen <dlarsen@reiengineering.com>

Subject: RE: Greater Bass

Dave, | would also recommend putting the MWs aband + closure pkg prep on this one also.

We are committed to service excellence.
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey to evaluate how | did.

Carrie Stoltz
Phone (715)365-8942
Carrie.Stoltz@Wisconsin.gov

From: Dave Larsen <dlarsen@reiengineering.com>
Sent: Wednesday, August 14, 2019 9:12 AM

To: Stoltz, Carrie R - DNR <Carrie.Stoltz@wisconsin.gov>
Subject: Greater Bass




Carrie, cost proposal to remove the remedial system ahead of case closure. We are getting pretty close
to exhausting the PECFA budget on this one. Intent is to sample once more and hopefully route this
one to closure. Groundwater is looking favorable for closure consideration.

Thank you,
David N. Larsen P.G
Senior Hydrogeologist / Professional Geologist

o A R David N. Larsen, P.G.
K ) Senior Hydrogeologist

Dlarseni RElengineering.com

CIVIL & ENVIRONMENTAL
ENGINEERING, SURVEYING

4080 N. 20th Avenue Tel: 1-877-7134-7745
Wausau, WI 54401 715-675-9784

RElIengineering.com Cell: 715-851-3434

Fax: 715-675-4060
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Usual and Customary Standardized Invoice #26

July 2019 - December 2019

WA—

DEPT. OF NATURAL RESOURCES

@%
=

RR-111a
PECFA #: 54485-9999-76 Vendor Name: REI
BRRTS #: 03-24-563946 Invoice #: U&C Total $  8,247.66
Site Name: Greater Bass Lake Storage, LLC Invoice Date: Proposal Date 8-14-19 Variance to U&C Total $ -
Site Address: N9276 Mill Road, Summit Lake Check #: Grand Total §  8,247.66

ACTIVITY
CODE

TASK DESCRIPTION

SERVICES

5 Closure Request CRO05
5 Closure Request CR15
5 Closure Request CR20
5 Closure Request CR30
8 Well Abandonment Consultant  WABO5
8 Well Abandonment Consultant  WAB10
8 Well Abandonment Consultant  WAB20
8 Well Abandonment Consultant  WAB30
25 Remediation System Shut Down SSD05
25 Remediation System Shut Down SSD15
36 Change Order Request CORO05

ACTIVITY REFERENCE CODE DESCRIPTION

Primary Closure Request Submittal
Continuing Obligation Packet Submittal (For Source Property Packet
Continuing Obligation Packet Submittal (For off-site Propertie PeLrAOd:;f‘it(\J/nal
PE review and certification of closure packet Site
Coordination Site
Water column < 30 ft Ft
Bentonite Pellets (50Ib bag - 1/4" pellet) Bag
Primary Mob/Demob Site
Permanent Site
Primary Mob/Demob Site

Change Order Request (cost cap exceedance requests) Change Order
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MAX UNIT
COST

2,781.00
522.58

229.39

1,129.60
162.86
2.60
11.14
398.48
1,128.33
520.91
393.23

UNITS

326
12

2,781.00
522.58

229.39

1,129.60
162.86
847.60
133.68
398.48

1,128.33
520.91
393.23



