
From: Kirsop, Patrick L - DNR
To: ken.pozorski@co.marathon.wi.us; Kafka, Terence - DNR
Cc: Limberg, Suzan C - DNR; Talbot, Linda M - DNR; Teves, Mary R - DNR
Subject: RE: Please use this one - Correct first pages for Nonpoint Grant: Matt Hartwig Barnyard Runoff COntrol Project (Grant

TRC-TRC37000BY16) - State Funds used as Match for Federal Funds
Date: Monday, December 28, 2015 4:35:55 PM
Attachments: Ken Pozorski - Marathon County (Matt Hartwig).pdf

USE this Pg 1 MATT HARTWIG TRC-TRC37000BY16.pdf

This email has the original grant agreement first page that I did not send with my first email.
 
Thanks,
 
We are committed to service excellence.
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey  to evaluate my customer service.
 
Patrick Kirsop
Bureau of Community Financial Assistance 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources 
(608) 266-2747 

 

From: Kirsop, Patrick L - DNR 
Sent: Monday, December 28, 2015 4:21 PM
To: 'ken.pozorski@co.marathon.wi.us'; Kafka, Terence - DNR
Cc: Limberg, Suzan C - DNR; Talbot, Linda M - DNR; Teves, Mary R - DNR (Mary.Teves@Wisconsin.gov)
Subject: Correct first pages for Nonpoint Grant: Matt Hartwig Barnyard Runoff COntrol Project (Grant TRC-
TRC37000BY16) - State Funds used as Match for Federal Funds
 
Hello Ken,
 
The Nonpoint Grant Marathon County received for the Matt Hartwig Barnyard Runoff Control Project
(Grant TRC-TR738000BY16) had an X missing in the box on page 1 of the grant agreement. The X lets you
know that the DNR is using the State funds for this grant as match to the Federal Grant funds we receive.
See the cover page you were initially sent below.
 
Please note that only this X on the first page was missing from the grant agreement that you received.
Specific conditions and requirements were included in B- Special Conditions under B.4, State Fund Match
Requirements of the original grant agreement. See attached original grant pdfs.
 
 
Attached is a pdf files (USE this….) with the cover pages only for the grant agreement with this one
change, the X showing that the State is using these grant funds to match Federal Funds.
 
Please replace the original page 1 with the enclosed page 1 pdf files (USE this…) with the X in the
appropriate place and return with your signed grant as directed in the original cover letter for the Matt
Hartwig grant. Email to DNRCFANONPOINTGRANTS@wisconsin.gov is preferred.
 
 
Thanks for your help. Please let me know if you have any questions.
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Best regards,
 
We are committed to service excellence.
Visit our survey at http://dnr.wi.gov/customersurvey  to evaluate my customer service.
 
Patrick Kirsop, PE
Chief, Grants Section 
Bureau of Community Financial Assistance 
Wisconsin Department of Natural Resources 
phone:      (608) 266-2747 
fax:         (608) 267-7904 
patrick.kirsop@wi.gov
 

 dnr.wi.gov
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